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Floor - Carpets 

Ningbo Lihua Household Products Co., 
Ltd H6.1 F85 
 
Founded in 1996, it is a professional 
carpet company that specializes in the 
R&D, design, production and sales of 
household and commercial carpets. The 
company is located in Jiangshan Town, 
Ningbo City, Zhejiang Province, covering 
an area of more than 40 acres and is a 
comprehensive base for R&D, design, 
production, warehousing and logistics. 

 
 

 

O Jia He Home Textile Co., Ltd H6.1 
G89 
 
They is a leading manufacturer with 
over 20 years of expertise in hand-
tufted carpets, now expanding into 
direct exports. Operating two factories 
and 15 workshops, they produce a wide 
range of acrylic, wool, and shaggy 
carpets in 20+ constructions. Their in-
house graphic design and R&D teams 
ensure innovative patterns and strict 
quality control across dyeing, tufting, 
and finishing processes. 

 

 

Shanghai Fuai Home Furnishings Co., 
Ltd H6.1 H98 
 
They established in 2021, specializes in 
importing premium home textile and 
soft furnishing products. Its product 
range includes high-end imported home 
décor and textile goods. The company is 
committed to authentic original imports 
and has forged strategic partnerships 
with 18 globally renowned home textile 
brands such as Orla Kiely, Ragolle, 
Sanderson, Ted Baker, Wedgwood etc, 
engaging in deep collaboration and co-
creation. It serves as an official multi-
brand distributor in China. 

 

 
 


